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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE  

OSHKOSH POLICE DEPARTMENT 

________________________________________ 
 

Date:   04/09/2025  
Time:  12:15 PM 

Contact:  Officer Kate Mann 
  Public Affairs/Crime Prevention Officer  

  (920 )236-5742 
Subject:   Human Trafficking Investigation Involving a Teenage Female 
 

OSHKOSH, WI (April 09, 2025): As a result of an intensive investigation, the 
Oshkosh Police Department arrested a male for numerous Human 

Trafficking charges involving a teenage female. 
 
On 04/08/2025 at approximately 11:26 PM, Detectives from the Oshkosh 

Police Department arrested a 26 year old male from Fond du Lac. He was 
located and taken into custody in the parking lot of a business located in 
the 200 Block of W 20th Avenue in the City of Oshkosh. An OPD detective 

was communicating with this male via the victim’s social media account 
(posing as the victim) and arranged to meet with him. The male wanted to 

meet with the victim for the purpose of sex acts. Detectives learned through 
the investigation that this male had met up with the victim on several 
different occasions in the past for the purpose of sex acts.  

 
The male was arrested for three counts of Soliciting a Child for Prostitution 
and three counts of Human Trafficking of a Child. A search warrant was 

issued for the suspect’s residence located in Fond du Lac County. As a 
result of the search warrant, numerous electronic devices were seized. We 

want to thank the Fond du Lac County Sheriff’s Office for their assistance in 
this incident. 
 

The Oshkosh Police Department remains steadfast in our unwavering 
commitment in combatting human trafficking and we continue to work 

diligently to investigate crimes of this nature- especially when these 
investigations involve juvenile victims. For a variety of reasons, it can be 
very hard for Human Trafficking victims to get out of these situations. We 

partner with local non-profit organizations so that resources can be quickly 
provided to victims.  
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The Mission of the Oshkosh Police Department is to promote public safety and to enhance the 
 quality of life in our community through innovative policing and community partnerships 

The Oshkosh Police Department strives to reduce the number of victims by 
doing proactive investigations and being vigilant in our efforts to combat 

Human Trafficking. Our door is always open to those seeking help, and we 
encourage anyone with information or concerns about human trafficking to 

come forward. Together, we can create a safer community and enhance the 
quality of life for everyone.  
 

If anyone has information regarding this incident, they are encouraged to 
contact the Oshkosh Police Department at 920-236-5700. If you have 
information about this incident, but wish to remain anonymous, please 
contact the Winnebago County Crime Stoppers at 920-231-8477; or through 
the P3 App.  

 


